
 

 
Bid Tabulation 

RFQ0029-19 Electrical Lineman Worker Gear and Equipment 
Bid Opened: August 28, 2019 at 2:00 p.m. 

 

       

 
Item Description 

 
Quantity  

J. Harlen 
Company 

Each 

Extended 
Price 

Grainger 
Each 

 

Extended 
Price 

 

Adj. Positioning Lanyard, 6ft 

L,AI 3M DBI-SALA 1234091 

16 215.00 3,440.00 234.83 3,757.28  

Four Way Grounding Set 

Salisbury 24308 
2 622.67 1,245.34 799.10 1,598.20  

External Rod Clampstick 

Salisbury 4009 
4 249.00 996.00 525.16 2,100.64  

Cable Cutter, 18-1/8 in, 350 

MCM/25MM Cap Westward 

22UN73 

4 134.64 538.56 Not 
Acceptable 

Not 
Acceptable 

 

Bolt[WT1] Cutter w/Fiberglass 

Handle, Steel Crescent 

H.K.Potter 0090FC 

4 110.77 443.08 138.10 552.40  

Crimper, 14 to 4/0 AWG, 25-

3/8” 381 L BURNDY MD68 
4 296.12 1,184.48 309.54 1,238.16  

Haven Grp, Forged.125-.50 

Cable 
6 146.40 878.40 115.98 695.88  

US End Product 2%  (143.47) (860.82)  N/A  
Super Squeeze, Web Friction 

Buckle 488W 
16 520.00 8,320.00 NO BID NO BID  

Locator, 3M, Dynatel, Cable, 

Faulty 2273, U3P3 
1 4,050.00 4,050.00 NO BID NO BID  

Tamper Bar, Wood Handle, 8ft 

1055 
4 82.17 328.68 NO BID NO BID  

Stick Telescopic, 35ft USTS035 4 487.20 1,948.80 NO BID NO BID  
Sling, Rope, 2-Leg, ½” Blue 

TS1248 
4 33.75 135.00 NO BID NO BID  

Hoist, Strap, Little Mule, 3000# 

300A 
6 310.20 1,861.20 NO BID NO BID  

Hoist, Roller Chain, 1500# AG 2 490.00 980.00 NO BID NO BID  
Handline System, 60ft with 

Block and Snap 2407.60 
8 217.25 1,738.00 NO BID NO BID  

Block, Snatch, 6”, 3-Ton, 1-1/4” 
Rope 4841 

2 543.95 1,087.90 NO BID NO BID  

Die Kit, 12-ton, U-Type 

UDIEKITCU 
1 1,103.65 1,103.65 NO BID NO BID  

Shipping and Handling 1 N/A N/A N/A N/A  
SC End Product 7%  N/A N/A N/A N/A  
Resident Vendor Preference 7%  N/A N/A N/A N/A  
US End Product 2%  143.47 860.82 N/A N/A  
(Maximum 10%)       

Grand Total Before Preference 
Deduct. 

  30,279.09  9,942.56  

Grand Total After Preference 
Deduct. 

  30,276.16  9,942.56  

Ranking       

 
______________________________________   ____________________________________ 
     Procurement Agent       Witness 


